
Retail For Lease 
309 West Martin Luther King, Jr. Blvd. 

Austin, Texas 78731 

Sam Calliham 
Harrison-Pearson Associates, Inc. 

4014 Medical Parkway, Ste.100 

Austin, Texas 78756 

(512) 472-6201 ext. 105 

e-mail: sam@hpaoffice.com 

Location & Description: The Premises is prominently 
located between Lavaca and Guadalupe, across Martin 
Luther King Blvd. from THE UNIVERSITY OF TEXAS. This 
prime retail space comprises the western most 1,228 
square feet of the one story commercial Building having 
street addresses of 305, 307 & 309 West Martin Luther 
King Blvd. The Premises is currently occupied by Empire Jiu 
Jitsu. 

Amenities Include: Excellent street exposure, large front 
retail area, adequate size stock room or office. 100% 
Central heat and air condition. One (1) restroom. 
 

Zoning & Uses: The existing Downtown Mixed Use Zoning 
classification (“DMU Zoning”) allows for most office and 
retail uses. 
 

Parking and Access: The “store-front” parking spaces 
accessible from Martin Luther King and located on the 
north side of the Building, are common to or shared by the 
customers of the three retail occupants of the Building. 
Additional employee parking is available on the south side 
of the Building (via alley).  Parking spaces 1 & 2 in the 
south parking area are exclusively reserved for the 
Premises during business hours. 
 

Signage: Store front signage provides excellent drive-by 
advertising exposure. 
 

Utilities: Tenant pays all utilities serving the Premises, 
including but not limited to electricity, water, wastewater, 
garbage and gas.  
 

Base Rent: The initial “Base Rental Rate” is $2,050 per 
month or $20.00 per square foot per annum. 
 

Additional Rent: In addition to Base Rent, Tenant is to pay 
“Additional Rent”, equal to the annual taxes assessed 
(currently estimated at $490.00 per month) and the 
annual insurance premium (currently estimated at $60.00 
per month). 
 

Term and Availability: Minimum 3-5 year term. The 
Premises will be available thirty (30) days from the 
execution date of a Lease. 

REAL ESTATE 
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Harrison-Pearson 

All information contained in this offering, while based on information furnished by the owner and is believed to be reliable, is subject to verification and Harrison-

Pearson makes no representation, express or implied, as to its accuracy.  Said information is subject to errors, omissions or changes and is subject to change of price or 

terms, or withdrawal without notice. 
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